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147 DESTINATIONS DIRECTLY FROM PRAGUE THIS SUMMER

Under the 2022 summer schedule,
Prague Airport will offer direct
connections to a total of 147
destinations operated by 58 air
carriers, including the resumed Delta
Air Lines’ route to New York. Places
such as Riyadh, Alicante, Almeria,
Faro, Porto, Tivat, Mykonos, and
Santorini will be newly added in the
flight schedule. Several new carriers
will also be introduced, such as Air

Montenegro, Flyr, flynas, and Play.  Learn more HERE

NEW PRAGUE – PORTO ROUTE

On 4 May 2022, easyJet launches its
direct flights to Porto, Portugal. The
route will be available to passengers
twice a week, on Wednesdays and
Saturdays. Porto was one of the top
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priorities in terms of the development
of air connections from Prague. It is a
popular destination with strong
potential, which has been missing on
the Prague Airport’s offer. Learn more
HERE

PRAGUE AIRPORT STARS CUSTOMER EXPERIENCE AREA

Prague Airport has received the 2021
Airport Service Quality Award,
presented annually by the Airports
Council International to the best
airports with the highest provable level
of customer experience satisfaction.
Prague Airport won the award in the
category of European airports
handling 15 – 25 million passengers a
year for the fourth time in a row. The
evaluation is based on the real

passenger experience and feedback.

CZECH REPUBLIC RELAXES ITS CONDITIONS FOR TRAVEL

In coordination with other European
Union countries, the Czech Republic
has relaxed the conditions for entry
into its territory effective 18 March
2022. Citizens of the European Union
and seven other countries can enter
the Czech Republic without any
restrictions, whether they are
vaccinated against Covid-19 or not. In
addition to the European Union
countries, the rule relaxation also

applies to countries such as Andorra, Iceland, Liechtenstein, Monaco, Norway, San
Marino, Switzerland, and the Vatican City State. Learn more HERE
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TERMINAL 3 RECONSTRUCTION CONTINUES

The Terminal 3 reconstruction has
already reached its final stage. Soon,
passengers will be able to use a
separate representative zone for
private flights with a brand-new
passport and security screening point,
new security features, and a modern
interior. The reconstruction of Terminal
3 premises, which are no longer
suitable in many respects, will
certainly contribute to increasing the

positive customer experience of travellers.
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